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The purpose of this “manual” is to provide authors and screenwriters with valuable information and insight
to enable them to create a better novel or screenplay in the genre of thriller, mystery, detective, spy, action
and adventure. The difference between a good novel or script, and a great novel or script, can be a greatly
enhanced income.

There can be little doubt that talented novelists and screenplay writers in these genres could create a
blockbuster product if they understood how police and intelligence officers think, how they react and what
they actually do. If a writer had access to this “insider” information, his or her product would soon rise above
the competition. I cannot tell you how to write a book or how to write a novel if you are already a talented
writer; I can tell you, however, how to make your book or movie much better if its genre is detective,
mystery, thriller or spy. This is the difference between a best seller or blockbuster, and novel or movie that
gets lost in the crowd.

The great majority of novels, TV shows and movies in this genre are so unrealistic, they could never be
classified as great works. Plots are vital to these stories and a writer cannot afford to leave holes in the plot
that a truck could be driven through. The purpose of this manual is to provide the “inside dope” on how law
enforcement and intelligence agencies operate, and just as importantly, how the officers and agents think and
approach problems and situations.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Barnes:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Write a Best Selling Novel: Understanding Cops and Spies.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some
sort of book Write a Best Selling Novel: Understanding Cops and Spies. You can add information and of
course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet
device. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's examine.

Leslie Heidelberg:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the figures do
it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Write a Best
Selling Novel: Understanding Cops and Spies, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about
yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Lesley Dwyer:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more
time to be study. Write a Best Selling Novel: Understanding Cops and Spies can be your answer mainly
because it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Nancy Soto:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also
know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims Write a Best Selling Novel:
Understanding Cops and Spies.
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