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Winner of the American Library Association's 2014 Boyd Award for Literary Excellence in Military
Fiction.
Between May 5 and June 3, 1864, the Union and Confederate armies suffered 88,000 casualties. Twenty-
nine thousand were killed, wounded or captured in the first two days of combat. The savagery shocked a
young, divided nation.

Against this backdrop of the birth of modern warfare and the painful rebirth of the United States, New York
Times bestselling novelist Ralph Peters has created a breathtaking narrative that surpasses the drama and
intensity of his recent critically acclaimed novel, Cain at Gettysburg.

In Hell or Richmond, thirty days of ceaseless carnage are seen through the eyes of a compelling cast, from
the Union's Harvard-valedictorian "boy general," Francis Channing Barlow, to the brawling "dirty boots"
Rebel colonel, William C. Oates. From Ulysses S. Grant and Robert E. Lee to a simple laborer destined to
win the Medal of Honor, Peters brings to life an enthralling array of leaders and simple soldiers from both
North and South, fleshing out history with stunning, knowledgeable realism.

From the horrific collision of armies in the Wilderness, where neither side wanted to fight, to the shocking
slaughter of the grand charge at Cold Harbor, this epic novel delivers a compelling, authentic, and
suspenseful portrait of Civil War combat.

Commemorating the approaching 150th anniversary of this grim encounter between valiant Americans,
Ralph Peters brings to bear the lessons of his own military career, his lifelong study of this war and the men
who fought it, and his skills as a bestselling, prize-winning novelist to portray horrific battles and sublime
heroism as no other author has done.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Case:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Hell or Richmond book because this book
offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no
doubt in it as you know.

Elizabeth Edge:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their friend.
Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing video games all
day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different you can read some sort of book. It
is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the entire day to
reading a reserve. The book Hell or Richmond it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space
bringing this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from your
smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book has high quality.

Kim McLoughlin:

Why? Because this Hell or Richmond is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to
snap it but latter it will surprise you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic
author who else write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside of easier to understand,
entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of gains than the other
book possess such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking method. So , still want to
delay having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Roberto Fetter:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you can have the
e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Hell or Richmond which is keeping the e-
book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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