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What was the Cold War? A simple definition might be: a 20th century international confrontation between
the Soviet Union and the United States, which involved, first, Europe, and then Asia, Africa, and Latin
America, eventually dividing the world into two camps. The key players in this global conflict are generally
identified as a number of high-ranking policymakers, including Harry S. Truman, Winston Churchill, and
Joseph Stalin. We know this story. However, the full story is not so simple. It is time to change our ways of
thinking about the Cold War.

Masuda Hajimu's Cold War Crucible is an inquiry into this peculiar nature of the Cold War. It examines
not only centers of policymaking, but seeming aftereffects of Cold War politics during the Korean War:
Suppression of counterrevolutionaries in China, the White Terror in Taiwan, the Red Purge in Japan, and
McCarthyism in the United States. Such purges were not merely end results of the Cold War, Masuda
argues, but forces that brought the Cold War into being, as ordinary people throughout the world strove to
silence disagreements and restore social order in the chaotic post-WWII era under the mantle of an imagined
global confrontation. Revealing social functions and popular participation, Cold War Crucible highlights
ordinary people's roles in making and maintaining the "reality" of the Cold War, raising the question of what
the Cold War really was.
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From reader reviews:

Robyn Pugh:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle
may doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing
that fantastic as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually Cold War Crucible: The Korean
Conflict and the Postwar World why because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the
content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Donald Sigman:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since book has a
lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you have
read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you act like you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The Cold War Crucible: The Korean Conflict and the Postwar World provide you with a new experience in
reading a book.

Norma Ochoa:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended for you is Cold War Crucible: The Korean Conflict and the Postwar World this
publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was
represented how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to
understand. The particular writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book
ideal all of you.

Jamie Norman:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. With this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just looking for
the Cold War Crucible: The Korean Conflict and the Postwar World when you essential it?
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