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First installment in the USA TODAY bestselling series of humorous women sleuth mysteries featuring
advertising copywriter and pet lover Leigh Koslow. Originally published in mass market paperback by
NAL/Penguin, Putnam, Inc. in 1999. Large-Print Edition published by Thorndike, 2002.

"A funny, fast-paced, clever, and unusual mystery that will have readers clamoring for more. Sheer
delight."--Carolyn Hart

"A thoroughly delightful debut. Bright, breezy, and witty. I couldn't put it down."--Tamar Myers

The truth about what happened in 1949 went to Paul Fischer's grave... Too bad his body didn't!

Advertising copywriter Leigh Koslow doesn't pack heat--just a few extra pounds. And she doesn't go looking
for trouble. When she moved into her cousin Cara's refurbished Victorian house, she wasn't planning on
discovering a corpse-certainly not one that had been embalmed ten years before. But as anyone in the small
Pittsburgh borough of Avalon could tell her, her cousin's house has a history attached. A history dating back
to two mysterious deaths in the summer of 1949.

Someone wants Leigh and Cara out of the house--someone who has something to hide. But that someone
doesn't know Leigh's impetuous cousin, and when Cara digs her heels in, Leigh looks to her old college
chum, local policewoman Maura Polanski, for help. But the answers the trio find only point to more
questions. Were the scandalous deaths of fifty years ago really an accident and a suicide? Or were they
murder?

The nearer the women get to the truth, the more desperate someone becomes. Because some secrets are
better off kept. Especially when they hit close to home!
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Treece:

The book Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time.
You need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book Never Buried: A Leigh
Koslow Mystery to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a book Never
Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this publication?

Olga Snider:

The guide with title Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery contains a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Tammy Campbell:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride on
and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery, you may enjoy
both. It is good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on
its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Shelly Sampson:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow
Mystery can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have
than the others?

Download and Read Online Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery



Edie Claire #N0G3FKPTW9Y



Read Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire for
online ebook

Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to read,
good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read books
online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to read
Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire books to read online.

Online Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire ebook PDF download

Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire Doc

Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire Mobipocket

Never Buried: A Leigh Koslow Mystery by Edie Claire EPub


