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BONUS: This edition contains a Magic Hour discussion guide.

In the rugged Pacific Northwest lies the Olympic National Forest—nearly a million acres of impenetrable
darkness and impossible beauty. From deep within this old growth forest, a six-year-old girl appears.
Speechless and alone, she offers no clue as to her identity, no hint of her past.

Having retreated to her western Washington hometown after a scandal left her career in ruins, child
psychiatrist Dr. Julia Cates is determined to free the extraordinary little girl she calls Alice from a prison of
unimaginable fear and isolation. To reach her, Julia must discover the truth about Alice’s past—although
doing so requires help from Julia’s estranged sister, a local police officer. The shocking facts of Alice’s life
test the limits of Julia’s faith and strength, even as she struggles to make a home for Alice—and for herself.
In Magic Hour, Kristin Hannah creates one of her most beloved characters, and delivers an incandescent
story about the resilience of the human spirit, the triumph of hope, and the meaning of home.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Frizzell:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Magic Hour: A Novel. Try to the actual book Magic Hour: A Novel
as your buddy. It means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside that of course
make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Clarence Kissel:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will certainly
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Magic Hour: A Novel is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish
in this era.

Lena Stubbs:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in
the top record in your reading list is definitely Magic Hour: A Novel. This book that is certainly qualified as
The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and review
this reserve you can get many advantages.

Tina Wilson:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Magic Hour: A Novel to make your
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try
to choose basic book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion about book and studying
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it. Beside that the guide Magic
Hour: A Novel can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing
of their time.
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