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Jack and Annie are ready for their next fantasy adventure in the bestselling middle-grade series—the Magic
Tree House!

An adventure that will shake you up!

That's what Jack and Annie get when the Magic Tree House whisks them back to California in 1906. As
soon as they arrive, the famous San Francisco earthquake hits the city. Can Jack and Annie find the final
writing that they need to help Morgan save Camelot? Or will San Francisco be destroyed first?

Visit the Magic Tree House website!
MagicTreeHouse.com
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From reader reviews:

Emily Sandlin:

The book Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping Stone Book(TM)) can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we
leave the best thing like a book Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping Stone
Book(TM))? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim in which book can give many
facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that
you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Earthquake in the
Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping Stone Book(TM)) has simple shape but the truth is
know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a
book. So it is very wonderful.

William Davis:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer can be Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping
Stone Book(TM)) why because the excellent cover that make you consider regarding the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Paulette Preston:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find book that need more time to be go through.
Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping Stone Book(TM)) can be your
answer since it can be read by a person who have those short extra time problems.

Catherine Graziani:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree
House #24) (A Stepping Stone Book(TM)) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we
know that book Earthquake in the Early Morning (Magic Tree House #24) (A Stepping Stone Book(TM))
has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation company
Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book usually are make
you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally
and try to like reading that.
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