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Investigating the murder of her grandfather, Storm Syrrell discovers that his arts and antiques business
served as a front for secret international dealings. Not only did her grandfather know of his impending death
but he also left her the responsibility for his lifetime quest.

Enter Harry Bennett, a professional treasure hunter just released from a Caribbean jail. And Emma Webb, a
Us Treasury agent with links to Interpol.

Their trail leads to London, France, Istanbul, Cyprus, and ever deeper into danger. A vital clue is discovered
within the Copper Scroll of Qumran: Hidden beneath the dusty mysteries of two thousand years lies a fortune
in gold with timeless significance.

With the tangled motives of greed and power coming into focus, something unexpected tugs at Storm. These
treasures represent a vital connection to an ancient faith. Will her quest include a personal transformation as
well?
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From reader reviews:

Darlene Johnson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure Series, Book 1).
Try to make the book Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure Series, Book 1) as your good friend. It means
that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than
previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more confidence because you
can know anything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Deana Smith:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to a person
is you don't know what one you should start with. This Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure Series, Book
1) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

James Smith:

Often the book Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure Series, Book 1) will bring that you the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. When you try to find
new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure
Series, Book 1) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site,
so you can quicker to read the book.

Helen Albertson:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in
the top record in your reading list is definitely Gold of Kings (Storm Syrrell Adventure Series, Book 1). This
book and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking
upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.
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