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In 1976, Stephen King started helping aspiring filmmakers get their big break through the Dollar Baby film
program. This deal allows filmmakers to create a short film based on one of King's available short stories, as
long as that story was not already optioned for a major movie or television show. Over 80 filmmakers made
Dollar Baby films over the next four decades and many of these filmmakers moved on to enjoy success in
the entertainment industry, with Frank Darabont (Shawshank Redemption, The Green Mile) as the Godfather
of the entire Dollar Baby phenomenon. Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby Filmmakers
tells the story of 19 of these filmmakers. Dollar Baby filmmaker Shawn S. Lealos (I Know What You Need)
interviews each of these filmmakers about their journey from college campuses to Hollywood, including
Peter Sullivan (Night Surf), Nick Wauters (Rainy Season), Jeff Schiro (The Boogeyman), Jay Holben
(Paranoid), and many more.
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Polk:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby
Filmmakers. Try to make book Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby Filmmakers as your
close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make
you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you considerably more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we should make new experience along with
knowledge with this book.

Patrick Cartwright:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Dollar Deal:
The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby Filmmakers suitable to you? The particular book was written by
famous writer in this era. Often the book untitled Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby
Filmmakersis the one of several books which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired a lot of
people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know previous to.
The author explained their plan in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to recognise the core of this
guide. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world in this book.

Josephine McIntire:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King
Dollar Baby Filmmakers can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out
of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?

Henry Hedrick:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know
that reading is very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these
claims Dollar Deal: The Story of the Stephen King Dollar Baby Filmmakers.
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