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The battle of White Horse lasted ten days, with many lives lost. This story concentrates on the first two days
of the battle, as recounted by Joe Adams, Jack Callaway, and the rest from the 213th Field Artillery Battalion
who were there. These two days coincide with the letters and personal remembrances of these men and this
story is based on their real life experiences. The events and people are real, coming from those personal
interviews, declassified documents and historical reference. What they went through is real, documented
history. This is a ¿story¿ in that their actual minute-by-minute interactions and words have been interpreted,
all with the spirit and intent of their every word. Not one of them has ever bragged about what they did or
thought of themselves as some great warrior soldier. Everyone simply did what they had to do, and that there
was no glory in it. Not just another war story, this is an attempt to put the reader ¿there¿ in the thick it, to be
a participant in battle and to feel what it was like to be in the Forgotten War. Exploding artillery shells,
bullets striking targets, the eeriness of flares drifting down over a battlefield, breathing the dust of trenches
on a hill in the middle of a far off place. Taking the reader out of their seat and putting a rifle in their hands,
this story transports you a thousand miles away from your surroundings to an artillery battery receiving
¿incoming mail¿, trench lines where death is around every corner, and a bunker on a hill where some of the
most violent combat takes place. This book lets you feel, taste and smell it like it was, brutal, unforgiving,
and above all, a cold hard reality for those that were there.
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From reader reviews:

Whitney Obrien:

Within other case, little persons like to read book A hill called White Horse: A Korean War story. You can
choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of
book A hill called White Horse: A Korean War story. You can add knowledge and of course you can around
the world by just a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can learn everything! From your country
right up until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you are able to
know that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book.
You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

John Oliver:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day
long to reading a book. The book A hill called White Horse: A Korean War story it is rather good to read.
There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In the
event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore
quickly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book possesses high
quality.

Penny Laughlin:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer might be A hill called White Horse: A Korean War story why because the
excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you
to pick up this book.

Brandy Anderson:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
in addition native or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. Through the book A hill called White Horse: A Korean War story we can have more advantage.
Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Only choose
the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book A hill
called White Horse: A Korean War story. You can more attractive than now.
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