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Born in Missouri in 1928, Maya Angelou had a difficult childhood. Jim Crow laws segregated blacks and
whites in the South. Her family life was unstable at times. But much like her poem, "Still I Rise," Angelou
was able to lift herself out of her situation and flourish. She moved to California and became the first
black—and first female—streetcar operator before following her interest in dance. She became a
professional performer in her twenties and toured the U.S. and Europe as an opera star and calypso dancer.
But Angelou's writing became her defining talent. Her poems and books, including I Know Why the Caged
Bird Sings, brought her international acclaim.
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From reader reviews:

Ila Petty:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book Who Was Maya Angelou? had been making you
to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for
you. The reserve Who Was Maya Angelou? is not only giving you a lot more new information but also being
your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to make
relationship with all the book Who Was Maya Angelou?. You never sense lose out for everything when you
read some books.

Evelina Soria:

Here thing why this specific Who Was Maya Angelou? are different and dependable to be yours. First of all
examining a book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as scrumptious as
food or not. Who Was Maya Angelou? giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any
e-book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Who Was Maya Angelou?. It gives you thrill
studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is maybe can be
happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your method
home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Who
Was Maya Angelou? in e-book can be your choice.

Amy Nichols:

This book untitled Who Was Maya Angelou? to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the
book retailer or you can order it through online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for you to past
this book from your list.

Wiley Wagner:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Who Was Maya Angelou?, you are able to
enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can
happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its known as reading friends.
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