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On July 26, Arthur Gordon learns that Europa, the sixth moon of Jupiter, has disappeared. Not hiding, not
turned black, but gone.

On September 28th, Edward Shaw finds an error in the geological records of Death Valley. A cinder cone
was left off the map. Could it be new? Or, stranger yet, could it be artificial? The answer may be lying beside
it—a dying Guest who brings devastating news for Edward and for Planet Earth.

As more unexplained phenomena spring up around the globe—a granite mountain appearing in Australia,
sounds emanating from the earth’s core, flashes of light among the asteroids—it becomes clear to some that
the end is approaching, and there is nothing we can do.

In The Forge of God, award-winning author Greg Bear describes the final days of the world on both a
massive, scientific scale and in the everyday, emotional context of individual human lives. Facing the
destruction of all they know, some people turn to God, others to their families, and a few turn to saviors
promising escape from a planet being torn apart. Will they make it in time? And who gets left behind to
experience the last moments of beauty and chaos on earth?

Nominated for a Nebula Award for Best Novel in 1987 and for Hugo and Locus Awards in 1988, The Forge
of God is an engrossing read, breathtaking in its scope and in its detail.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Goodman:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want experience happy read
one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The The Forge of God is kind of book which is
giving the reader unpredictable experience.

David Binkley:

The book with title The Forge of God includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of
gain after read this book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of
the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on
your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Paul Jackson:

Beside this particular The Forge of God in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh in the oven so don't end up
being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Forge
of God because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you
rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set
up here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find
this book as well as read it from now!

Steven Delorme:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news.
On this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the The Forge of God when you required it?
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