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The definitive groundbreaking book on the relationship between birds and humankind, with
contributions from more than 600 bird enthusiasts from all over the world
 
Part natural history and part cultural study, this book describes and maps the entire spectrum of human
engagements with birds, drawing in themes of history, literature, art, cuisine, language, lore, politics, and the
environment. Vast in both scope and scale, it draws upon Mark Cocker's 40 years of observing and thinking
about birds to celebrate this relationship. The book is as important for its visual riches as it is for its
groundbreaking content, as one of Europe's best wildlife photographers has traveled in 39 countries on seven
continents to produce a breathtaking and unique collection of photographs. The author solicited contributions
from people worldwide, and personal anecdotes and stories have come from more than 600 individuals of 81
different nationalities, ranging from university academics to Mongolian eagle hunters, and from Amerindian
shamans to highly celebrated writers. The sheer multitude of voices in this global chorus means that it is both
a source book on why we cherish birds and a powerful testament to their importance for all humanity.
Endorsed by the Royal Society for the Protection of Birds and Birdlife International.
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From reader reviews:

Otis Thompson:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Birds & People will make you to possibly be smarter.
You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think in which open or
reading some sort of book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have
you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Steve Diaz:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for us. The book Birds & People ended up being making you to know about other knowledge
and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The reserve Birds &
People is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored.
You can spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with the book Birds &
People. You never feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Frank Tye:

Beside this Birds & People in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Birds &
People because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but you seldom get
what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand.
The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you
still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from now!

Brenda Moulton:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but novel and Birds & People or even others sources were
given understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel desire to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those publications are helping them to
bring their knowledge. In various other case, beside science publication, any other book likes Birds & People
to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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