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This volume guides readers through the world of the Bible, the land where the decisive religious experiences
of the ancient Israelites and the earliest Christians took place. One cannot understand Judaism or Christianity
without knowing not only the history and culture but also the geography of the biblical lands. Here the
authors bring together the fruits of contemporary historical and archaeological research to introduce the
writings, events, and, most important the land of the Bible. The Land and the Book provides an overview of
the geography and the history of the Bible by the use of brief descriptions of each of the major areas in which
the events of the biblical narrative took place ( primarily Palestine, Egypt, and Syria) and reviews of the
history of ancient Israel, beginning with the patriachs and continuing through the New Testament era and the
crusader period to the present. Extensive archaeological and historical descriptions set the stage for a more
thorough understanding of the biblical drama by detailing the natural environment of a site; the human
artifacts, buildings, and structures discovered there; and the manner in which all illuminate the biblical
material * Includes charts and descriptions of archaeological periods, a chronological chart of biblical events,
and a glossary of terms-- helps the reader better understand the world of the Bible.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Scott:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This The Land and the Book: An Introduction to the World of the Bible
book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you.
The writer of The Land and the Book: An Introduction to the World of the Bible content conveys the thought
easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it
just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Land and the Book: An Introduction to the
World of the Bible is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Virgil Arriola:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving The Land and the Book: An
Introduction to the World of the Bible that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading
this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world far better
then how they react toward the world. It can't be said constantly that reading practice only for the geeky
person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start studying
as your good habit, you may pick The Land and the Book: An Introduction to the World of the Bible become
your current starter.

Michael Collins:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Land and the Book: An Introduction to
the World of the Bible can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of
date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Robert Shaw:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know everything
we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended up being
exactly added. This publication The Land and the Book: An Introduction to the World of the Bible was filled
concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big selling point of a book,
you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you
wanted.
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