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Robert William Dale (1 December 1829 – 13 March 1895) was an English Congregationalist church leader.
He normally read his sermons, because 'if I spoke extemporaneously I should never sit down again'. He did
not use the title 'Reverend'. He was a strong advocate of the disestablishment of the Church of England,
holding that the Christian church was essentially a spiritual brotherhood, and that any vestige of political
authority impaired its spiritual work. In church government he believed strongly that congregationalism was
the most fitting environment for Christianity. He published lectures such as the Atonement (which is still in
print), sermons, the 'Manual of Congregational Principles' (also still in print),
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This book originally published in 1875 has been reformatted for the Kindle and may contain an occasional
defect from the original publication or from the reformatting.
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From reader reviews:

Maxine Elam:

The book The Atonement: Congregational Union Lecture can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book The Atonement: Congregational Union
Lecture? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many
details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that you
take for that, you are able to give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Atonement:
Congregational Union Lecture has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you.
You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Joseph Haner:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This The Atonement: Congregational Union Lecture
can give you a lot of good friends because by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't
and make you more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than additional make
you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Atonement: Congregational Union
Lecture.

Tyler Cote:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book The Atonement: Congregational Union Lecture
was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The Atonement:
Congregational Union Lecture has many kinds or category. Start from kids until youngsters. For example
Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book
usually are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book in your
case and try to like reading this.

Donna Robinson:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book The Atonement:
Congregational Union Lecture to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading
expertise is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the sensation about book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open
a book and read it. Beside that the e-book The Atonement: Congregational Union Lecture can to be your
friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of their time.
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