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One of the all-time great animal stories and a true classic of children's literature by Kenneth Grahame. The
Wild Wood seems a terrifying place to Mole, until he finds it's full of friends - Kind, sleepy Badger; brave
and lively Ratty; and the irresponsible Mr Toad, famous for his wealth and his car smashes. But there are
also the sinister weasels and stoats, and they capture Toad Hall when Mr Toad is in jail. How will he escape?
And can the friends fight together to save Toad Hall? Kenneth Grahame's classic The Wind in the Willows
needs no introduction. Entertaining adults and children alike for over a hundred years, characters such as
Ratty, Mole, Badger and, of course, the irrepressible Mr Toad have influenced children's animal stories ever
since. Fun, exciting, whimsical and dangerous at times, The Wind in the Willows can't help but spark a
child's imagination. In this Egmont Heritage edition, Kenneth Grahame's animal book, is made all the more
beautiful and enthralling thanks to the original illustrations by E. H. Shepard, the man who also drew
Winnie-the-Pooh. A stunning gift book for any child or inner child.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Foxworth:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible The Wind in the Willows?
Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time together with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have different
opinion?

Melissa Sanders:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking The Wind in the Willows that
give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the
world can be said as the method for people to know world a great deal better then how they react toward the
world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky particular person but for all
of you who wants to always be success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you could pick The Wind in the Willows become your starter.

Luther Jensen:

It is possible to spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This The Wind in the Willows is simple to
create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have got
much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it.
You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when
you buy this book.

Robert Journey:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And also you
know that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update about something by book. Amount
types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is The Wind in the Willows.
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