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Following a near fatal carriage collision, the beautiful young Carmilla is taken in by the narrator Laura and
her father. The two young women become strangely attracted to each other, but there seems to be more to
Carmilla than meets the eye. After her arrival in the village, local peasants begin to die and Laura falls ill and
languishes. What is Carmilla's true identity, and can she be to blame?

A thrilling Victorian tale of horror and mystery and a major influence on Stoker's Dracula, Carmilla remains
one of Sheridan Le Fanu's most enduring works. This Valancourt Books edition, the first-ever scholarly
edition of Le Fanu's novella, follows the rare original text as it appeared serially in The Dark Blue in 1871-72
(including the original illustrations) and includes a new introduction and footnotes by Jamieson Ridenhour.
Also featured in this edition is a wealth of contextual material, including texts by Yeats, Coleridge, Stoker,
Padraig Pearse, and others, and the complete texts of Le Fanu's "The Child that Went with the Fairies" and
F.G. Loring's "The Tomb of Sarah."
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From reader reviews:

Heather Goodson:

Carmilla can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away
because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to set every word
into delight arrangement in writing Carmilla nevertheless doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the
hottest along with based confirm resource data that maybe you can be among it. This great information could
drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Sheila Powell:

You can find this Carmilla by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it can to be your
solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by means
of written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just
looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to
get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Michael Stricklin:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Carmilla was bright colored and of course has
pictures on the website. As we know that book Carmilla has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and
loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading in which.

Sean Jones:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you
know that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is Carmilla.
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