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When Martine and her grandmother discover that they might lose their game reserve, Sawubona, because of
a clause in her grandfather's will, Martine and her best friend, Ben, decide to take matters into their own
hands. After Martine hears a prophecy that tells her: "The elephants will lead you to the truth," Martine and
Ben stow away in an airplane, get stuck in the desert, and help a group of elephants escape from a horrible
prison. Along the way, Martine learns the truth about Sawubona, as well as the dramatic truth about her gift
with animals and where it will take her in her life . . .
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From reader reviews:

Yasmin Parker:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible The Elephant's
Tale (Legend of the Animal Healer)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend
your time together with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with its opinion or
you have various other opinion?

Denise Lee:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or
their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want
to try out look for book, may be the publication untitled The Elephant's Tale (Legend of the Animal Healer)
can be excellent book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Michael Earl:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely yes. People
is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when the spare time coming to a
person of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading books. It can
be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read will be The Elephant's
Tale (Legend of the Animal Healer).

Jenna Quintana:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't work here
is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside appearance likes.
Maybe you answer is usually The Elephant's Tale (Legend of the Animal Healer) why because the excellent
cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or
content is usually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to
pick up this book.
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