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Since its origins in the 1970s, punk has had an explosive influence on fashion. With its eclectic mixing of
stylistic references, punk effectively introduced the postmodern concept of bricolage to the elevated
precincts of haute couture and directional ready-to-wear. As a style, punk is about chaos, anarchy, and
rebellion. Drawing on provocative sexual and political imagery, punks made fashion overtly hostile and
threatening. This aesthetic of violence – even of cruelty – was intrinsic to the clothes themselves, which were
often customized with rips, tears, and slashes, as well as studs, spikes, zippers, D-Rings, safety pins, and
razor blades, among other things.

This extraordinary publication examines the impact of punk’s aesthetic of brutality on high fashion,
focusing on its do-it-yourself, rip-it-to-shreds ethos, the antithesis of couture’s made-to-measure exactitude.
Indeed, punk’s democracy stands in opposition to fashion’s autocracy. Yet, as this book reveals, even haute
couture has readily appropriated the visual and symbolic language of punk, replacing beads with studs,
paillettes with safety pins, and feathers with razor blades in an attempt to capture the style’s rebellious
energy. Focusing on high fashion’s embrace of punk’s aesthetic vocabulary, this book reveals how designers
have looked to the quintessential anti-establishment style to originate new ideals of beauty and
fashionability.
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From reader reviews:

Julia Hayes:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Punk: Chaos to Couture (Metropolitan Museum of Art).
You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any
book Punk: Chaos to Couture (Metropolitan Museum of Art). You can add information and of course you
can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything!
From your country until finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple factor until wonderful
thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You need to use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

Linda Yohe:

The book with title Punk: Chaos to Couture (Metropolitan Museum of Art) contains a lot of information that
you can study it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Christine Flint:

Typically the book Punk: Chaos to Couture (Metropolitan Museum of Art) has a lot associated with on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author.
The author makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may
get the point easily after scanning this book.

Emmaline Jett:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Punk: Chaos to
Couture (Metropolitan Museum of Art) provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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