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America's two party system is highly stable, but its parties' issue positions are not. Democrats and
Republicans have changed sides on many subjects, including trade, civil rights, defense spending, and fiscal
policy, and polarized on newer issues like abortion and gun control. Yet party position change remains
poorly understood. In this book David Karol views parties as coalitions of groups with intense preferences on
particular issues managed by politicians. He explains important variations in party position change: the speed
of shifts, the stability of new positions, and the extent to which change occurs via adaptation by incumbents.
Karol shows that the key question is whether parties are reacting to changed preferences of coalition
components, incorporating new constituencies, or experimenting on "groupless" issues. He reveals that
adaptation by incumbents is a far greater source of change than previously recognized. This study enhances
our understanding of parties, interest groups, and representation.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Cotner:

What do you about book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to
the fact just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Party Position Change in
American Politics: Coalition Management to read.

Leroy Torres:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Party Position Change in American Politics: Coalition Management book is
readable simply by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you.
The writer involving Party Position Change in American Politics: Coalition Management content conveys
the thought easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content
but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Party Position Change in American Politics:
Coalition Management is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Kellie Smith:

The actual book Party Position Change in American Politics: Coalition Management has a lot of knowledge
on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the
very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research ahead of write this book. This particular book very easy
to read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Mable Watkins:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. Among the books in the top
listing in your reading list is Party Position Change in American Politics: Coalition Management. This book
and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking
right up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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