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England 1536. Bridget Manning is forced to leave the safety and tranquillity of her home at Rivers Abbey in
order to join the household of the queen, Anne Boleyn. Once there she enters a world seething with intrigue
and plots against her new mistress. Will Bridget be able to navigate her way through the dangerous maze of
the court or will it destroy her as it is destroying her queen?

The sequel to this book, "Court of Traitors", is now available. The third book in the series,"Masque of
Deception", will now be published in February 2015 as I decided to make some changes ( SO sorry for the
delay, I promise it is coming!)

NOTE TO READERS: There were some formatting problems with this book that have now been remedied. I
apologise for any inconvenience that was caused.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Pinkerton:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Ambition's Queen (Bridget Manning #1). Try to the actual book Ambition's
Queen (Bridget Manning #1) as your close friend. It means that it can being your friend when you really feel
alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case.
The book makes you far more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to
make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Jane Abraham:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Ambition's Queen (Bridget Manning #1)
reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand
by anyone who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only
for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Ambition's Queen (Bridget Manning #1) as
good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate
book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your looking at
sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Solomon Steward:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to your account is Ambition's Queen (Bridget Manning #1) this book consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.

Richard Bennett:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of
news. With this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just looking for the Ambition's Queen (Bridget Manning #1) when you required it?
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