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The Deluxe Edition of The Self-made Billionaire Effect includes seven videos of authors John Sviokla
and Mitch Cohen expanding on the book’s themes and their findings, along with behind-the-scenes
insights into what makes self-made billionaires unique.A study of self-made billionaires reveals the key
distinction between “producers” and “performers”

There are about 800 self-made billionaires in the world today. What enables this elite group to create truly
massive value, and what can the rest of us learn from them?

John Sviokla and Mitch Cohen set out to answer this question with the first systematic study of 120 self-
made billionaires, including extensive interviews with icons like Steve Case, Mark Cuban, and T. Boone
Pickens, Jr. The authors conclude that self-made billionaires aren't necessarily smarter, harder working, or
luckier than their peers. The key difference is what they call the “producer” mindset, in contrast to the far
more common “performer” mindset.

Performers strive to excel in well-defined areas, and they are essential to any company. But producers are
even more valuable because they redefine what's possible, rather than simply meeting pre-existing goals and
standards. Producers think up entirely new products, services, strategies, and business models, with dramatic
results.

This book offers fresh stories and insights into producers' habits of mind. It also provides corporate leaders
with a new approach to selecting and managing breakthrough talent, and advice about innovation and value
creation for aspiring leaders or entrepreneurs.
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From reader reviews:

Rachel Robertson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme
Producers Create Massive Value. Try to face the book The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How
Extreme Producers Create Massive Value as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you feel
alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The
book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let us
make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Maria Vanness:

The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme Producers Create Massive Value can be one of your
nice books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good
vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction
arrangement in writing The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme Producers Create Massive
Value although doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This great information can easily drawn you into new stage
of crucial pondering.

Agatha Roughton:

The book untitled The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme Producers Create Massive Value
contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains her idea with easy method. The language is very
easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was authored
by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of time of literary works. You can easily read this
book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and order
it. Have a nice examine.

Stella Carpenter:

This The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme Producers Create Massive Value is brand new
way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of
information. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having
bit of digest in reading this The Self-made Billionaire Effect Deluxe: How Extreme Producers Create
Massive Value can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this kind of book is
easy to get by anyone. These books create itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, that's why I



mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy
this e-book is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are
looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book kind for your better
life as well as knowledge.
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