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After surviving the trials of the Magic Games, mercenary mage Sera Dering is back home in San Francisco.
She wants nothing more than to relax and finally have a long-overdue date with dragon shifter Kai.

Unfortunately, the universe has other plans.

When a young boy is kidnapped by vampires, Sera’s friend Naomi enlists her help to save him. And
sometime between fighting monsters, thwarting pirates, and convincing a grumpy ghost to help them, Sera is
determined to finish her date.

Magic Nights is the third book in the Dragon Born Serafina urban fantasy series.

The Dragon Born Series

The Dragon Born Serafina and Dragon Born Alexandria sister series can be read independently or together.
Suggested reading order:

Mercenary Magic (Dragon Born Serafina, Book 1)●

Magic Edge (Dragon Born Alexandria, Book 1)●

Magic Games (Dragon Born Serafina, Book 2)●

Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina, Book 3)●

Blood Magic (Dragon Born Alexandria, Book 2) ~ coming soon!●

And more books coming later...●
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From reader reviews:

Warren Matt:

Often the book Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina Book 3) has a lot associated with on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was published by the very famous author.
The writer makes some research before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can obtain
the point easily after perusing this book.

Charles Tapia:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics,
in addition to soon. The Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina Book 3) offer you a new experience in
studying a book.

James Fong:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina Book 3) was filled regarding
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can experience
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Pearl Dyson:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina Book 3) to
make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when
you just like reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the opinion about
book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside
that the e-book Magic Nights (Dragon Born Serafina Book 3) can to be your new friend when you're feel
alone and confuse with what must you're doing of this time.
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