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Learn about the life of the 43rd President of the United States in this updated biography of George W. Bush,
specially written for a younger audience.

President George W. Bush once said, “I never dreamed about becoming president. When I was growing up, I
wanted to be Willie Mays.”

George W. was born July 6, 1946, in New Haven, Connecticut. He grew up in Texas but returned to
Connecticut to attend Yale University. As a young man he trained as a fighter pilot in the Texas Air National
Guard before beginning a career in business. He entered Texas politics and served as the state’s governor
from 1994 to 2000.

In 2001 George W. Bush won one of the closest, and most disputed, presidential elections in United States
history. During his first term Bush launched a war against terrorism after the devastating attacks of
September 11, 2001. In 2004 he won his second term against John Kerry.

Originally published as President George W. Bush in 2005, this revised biography of the 43rd President of
the United States includes eight pages of photos as well as a timeline and index.
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From reader reviews:

Sylvia Silva:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name George W. Bush:
Our Forty-Third President (A Real-Life Story) suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in
this era. The actual book untitled George W. Bush: Our Forty-Third President (A Real-Life Story)is the one
of several books this everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read
this publication you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in
the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a
large amount of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this book.

David Gehrke:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or even their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write
about the information about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them
is this George W. Bush: Our Forty-Third President (A Real-Life Story).

Debra Weeks:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your free time/
holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you
will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to consider look for book, may
be the e-book untitled George W. Bush: Our Forty-Third President (A Real-Life Story) can be fine book to
read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Kenneth Copeland:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can read some
sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day
every day to reading a guide. The book George W. Bush: Our Forty-Third President (A Real-Life Story) it
doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. We were
holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy



the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not very costly
but this book possesses high quality.
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