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Sugar Is Not Love

Do you have a smart, creative, loving child who is also cranky, inattentive, and sometimes downright
obnoxious? If you’ve written off this negative behavior as “typical” for your child’s age—whether toddler or
teen—stop and think: Does your child have a taste for soda, sugary breakfast cereals, and treats like candy
and cookies? Does she eat regularly scheduled meals or skip them? What, exactly, does he drink and snack
on throughout the day?

Your child’s behavior may be linked to diet—specifically to the sugar in obvious sources like sweets and
soda and to hidden sugars that lurk in many foods, fruit-based drinks, and “healthy” snacks like granola bars.
And if your son or daughter is sugar sensitive, misbehavior and moodiness can be aggravated by missed or
late meals and junk foods.

Now, bestselling author Kathleen DesMaisons offers you a workable solution for getting back your child by
changing his diet—without creating a sense of deprivation, without setting unrealistic goals, and without
turning sugar into “forbidden fruit.” This book offers:

• A step-by-step program, backed by years of research, for gradually improving the food your child
eats—you and your whole family will benefit!
• Tips for navigating the sugar-laden world of birthday parties, holidays, and school cafeterias
• Ways to incorporate healthy snacking and regular mealtimes into your child’s day, including suggestions
for meals and snacks, plus recipes

Little Sugar Addicts isn’t about strange foods, dramatic lifestyle changes, or complicated menus—just
support, guidance, and real-life suggestions from other parents that work. It will help you make the
connection between the addictive qualities of sugar and negative behavior and offer a healthy solution you
and your whole family can live with.
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From reader reviews:

Carlos Vickers:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a wander,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible Little Sugar Addicts:
End the Mood Swings, Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low Self-Esteem in Your Child Today? Maybe it is to be
best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Todd Voss:

The book Little Sugar Addicts: End the Mood Swings, Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low Self-Esteem in Your
Child Today give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem
with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Little Sugar Addicts: End the Mood Swings,
Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low Self-Esteem in Your Child Today to become your habit, you can get much
more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You
could know everything if you like start and read a book Little Sugar Addicts: End the Mood Swings,
Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low Self-Esteem in Your Child Today. Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Rigoberto Hamilton:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the
actual book you have read is Little Sugar Addicts: End the Mood Swings, Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low
Self-Esteem in Your Child Today.

Richard McCormick:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news.
With this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Little Sugar Addicts: End the Mood Swings, Meltdowns, Tantrums, and Low Self-Esteem in Your
Child Today when you desired it?
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